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What is a Resume? 

 

Hi! I’m Maria and this is Michelle. 
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Michelle is getting ready to apply for jobs so she needs to create a resume. A 
resume is a written document that summarizes a person’s skills, experience and 
education. It shows that a person is a good fit for a particular job opening.  
 

 
 
The purpose of a resume is to convince a potential job employer to offer a job 
interview, and ultimately, to offer a job. We will walk Michelle through the 
process, as she makes decisions about what to include in her resume, and what 
format to use. 
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There are a few different approaches to writing a resume. The two main types of 
resumes are the traditional resume and the functional resume. Your unique 
experience as well as the specific job you are applying for will help determine the 
type of resume that is best for you. 
 

 
 
A traditional resume is also known as a chronological resume. This type of 
resume focuses on your work history, which is listed in reverse chronological 
order. 
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This means that your most recent job is listed at the top, followed by older jobs. 
Specific job duties and accomplishments are listed below each position. You 
would use this type of resume when your most recent job history is relevant to 
the current job with which you are applying.  
 

 
 
In this example, the applicant is applying for an administrative position. Her most 
recent job history includes similar jobs as a receptionist and as an administrative 
assistant. Her work history is relevant to the current job she’s applying for. So 
she has decided to use a traditional, chronological resume.  
 
 



   

5 

 

 
 
A functional resume focuses on skills and accomplishments that can be pulled 
from several different jobs.  
 

 
 
This is follow by a brief list of the positions, companies, and dates of your work 
history.  
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A functional resume focuses on your skills and abilities by placing them into 
categories. Job titles and dates of employment are not emphasized. This is not 
as common as the traditional resume but it may be a good choice if your recent 
jobs do not relate to the position for which you are applying.  
 

 
 
In this example, the applicant is interested in a receptionist position but her work 
history has been in the nursing field. Since her work history differs from the 
current job she wants, she’s using a functional resume. She has listed her skills 
and abilities that are relevant to the current receptionist job using categories. This 
helps the potential employer see that she has skills relevant to the position even 
if her previous jobs have been in a different field. 



   

7 

 
Quiz 
 

 
 
Michelle is applying for administrative assistant jobs and has a recent job history 
with receptionist and administrative assistant titles. Since Michelle is applying for 
jobs in the same field as her job history, which resume should she use? 
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If your answer is Traditional: 

 
 
That’s right. Since Michelle has a work history that is closely related to what she 
is applying for, she can use the traditional, chronological resume format. This 
format focuses on her job history and shows how her previous jobs have prepare 
her to be a good candidate for her current job.   
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If your answer is Functional: 
 

 

Oops. Actually, a traditional, chronological resume format is the best choice for 

Michelle. This is because her work history is closely related to what she is 

applying for. The traditional format focuses on her job history and shows how her 

previous jobs have prepared her to be a good candidate for her current job.   
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Whichever format you choose, your resume should include your contact 
information, work history, details about your accomplishments, and your 
education. We’ll look at these sections in more detail in the next lesson. 
 
 
 


